EIR FOI and SAR Disclosure Report

PE\2025\ENQ\51824

PE\2025\ENQ\51737

PE\2025\ENQ\51946

Enquiry Type |Enquiry Reference

Description Enquiry Enquiry

EIR - Please provide the following data. 1. The number of major housing developments (10 or 31 Jan 2025 17 Feb 2025 27 Feb 2025 YES
more dwellings) in your jurisdiction which were completed between the years 2021-2025
inclusive which had a Section 106 (Town and Country Planning Act 1990) planning obligation.
2. Of these completed developments, the number which changed the stipulations of their S106
obligations, or did not provide them, by the time of completion. For these, please provide the
following: 2a. The name of the development, the developer name, and original planning
permission reference. 2b.The obligations the developer agreed to as part of the Section 106 to
the council upon initial planning permission being granted. 2c. A summary of the final delivery
(including built property or financial contributions) provided by the developer to fulfil the
Section 106 agreement, upon completion of the building contract. 2ci. Any reasons given by
the developer for any difference between the initial agreement and final delivery. 2cii. If any
developer did not provide anything by way of fulfilment of the Section 106 agreement, please
summarise any further action taken by the council, including but not limited to litigation,
requiring a replacement contribution of any kind, such as a financial contribution, discontinuing
the building project, etc. Please provide this data in an excel spreadsheet.

RESPONSE:

17/02/2025 - Final response - information provided

EIR - Self-build and custom housebuilding (England), see full details of request on HUB/NEC 17 Jan 2025 24 Jan 2025 13 Feb 2025 YES
DM.

RESPONSE:
24/01/2025 - Final response - information provided

EIR - Various questions on surveying and geospatial services. 19 Feb 2025 11 Mar 2025 18 Mar 2025 YES
See full details of request on HUB

RESPONSE:
11/03/2025 - Final response - information provided

Date Closed Target Date| Within

Date
ERRequest | | _ _____ __ ___ ______ __ ____________ | __ |

Appeal
Received

Taraet
]

NO

NO

NO



PE\2025\ENQ\51821

EIR - The number of major housing developments (10 or more dwellings) in your jurisdiction 30 Jan 2025 17 Feb 2025 26 Feb 2025 YES
which were

completed between the years 2021-2025 inclusive which had a Section 106 (Town and Country
Planning Act 1990) planning obligation.

Of these completed developments, the number which changed the stipulations of their S106
obligations, or did not provide them, by the time of completion. For these, please provide the
following:

The name of the development, the developer name, and original planning permission
reference.

The obligations the developer agreed to as part of the Section 106 to the council upon initial
planning permission being granted.

A summary of the final delivery (including built property or financial contributions) provided by
the developer to fulfil the Section 106 agreement, upon completion of the building contract.

Any reasons given by the developer for any difference between the initial agreement and final
delivery.

If any developer did not provide anything by way of fulfilment of the Section 106 agreement,
please summarise any further action taken by the council, including but not limited to litigation,
requiring a replacement contribution of any kind, such as a financial contribution, discontinuing
the building project, etc.

RESPONSE:
17/02/2025 - Final response - information provided

NO



PE\2025\ENQ\52089

PE\2025\ENQ\51897

PE\2025\ENQ\51894

EIR - Please provide a list (in Excel format) of all planning applications submitted from 12th
September 2024 to the most recent data available where no decision was made within the
statutory period (26 weeks for major applications and 16 weeks for non-major applications),
unless a longer period has/had been agreed in writing between the applicant and the Local
Authority, and no refund of fees has been made to date.

Requested Columns:

. Planning application reference

. Applicant name

. Site address

. Valid date

. Planning application fee paid (£)

. Decision due date

. Actual decision date

. No. of days to decision

. The decision (e.g., approved, refused, etc.)

10. Extension of time/Planning performance agreement in writing (Yes or No)

11. Refund (Yes or No)

12. Eligible for Refund (Yes or No) (Based on statutory decision deadlines: 16 weeks for non-
major applications and 26 weeks for major applications)

13. Withdrawn (Yes or No)

14. Proposal description

Please provide the information in chronological (date) order.

OOoONOOULAWNH

24/03/2025 - Final response - do not record the information in a way that makes it easy to
cross reference betwen the transaction records in the finance system and the application

vnfAavanan mimabhavs im M2 Can enfiind infammatinn mak vacacdad im M2

EIR - Please could you supply me with the details of Significant / Multi Loads fly-tipping
incidents recorded by the authority over the most recent 12 months on record, as well as the
previous 12 months on record (separately).

In particular:

1. The specific location of the incidents

2. How much waste was dumped (rough estimate is acceptable)

3. Whether it was cleared up in full

4. How much it cost to clear it up

5. Was there any enforcement as a result, and if so, what?

6. If perpetrators were fined, then please provide the amount they were fined. If they were
jailed, then please provide the sentence length. If the authority doesn't have access to this
information, then please proceed with the other parts of the request and ignore this question.

RESPONSE:
17/02/2025 - Final response - information not held

EIR request for details of numbers of entries on the Authority's self-build register for each year
from 2015-2025.

10/03/2025 - Final response - information provided.

12 Mar 2025 24 Mar 2025

10 Feb 2025 17 Feb 2025

11 Feb 2025 10 Mar 2025

08 Apr 2025 YES

07 Mar 2025 YES

10 Mar 2025 YES

NO

NO

NO



PE\2025\ENQ\51865 EIR Request: There is an exempt minute and report that I am interested in seeing if possible. 06 Feb 2025 20 Mar 2025 20 Mar 2025 YES NO
The
meeting is Audit Resources and Performance Committee 22 May 2015 and the item is 32/15
Woodlands Disposal Project.

The item was exempt at the time presumably because of commercial sensitivity but the
woodlands have now been disposed of and I don't think the reason it was exempt still applies.

If necessary, please could you consider this a request under the Environmental Information
Regulations.

RESPONSE:
20/05/2025 - Final response, some information provided, redaction of woodlands that are still
under consideration for disposal - Regulation 12(5)(e) commercial confidentiality.

FOI Request ———————
PE\2025\ENQ\51684 FOI request - What is the headcount (number) of staff employed in communications, 07 Jan 2025 24 Jan 2025 03 Feb 2025 YES
marketing, press and public affairs in your organisation?

RESPONSE:

24/01/202K - Final racnnneca - infarmatinn nravided



PE\2024\ENQ\51601

PE\2025\ENQ\51813

PE\2025\ENQ\51736

FOI - I am researching planning appeal cost awards for the Planning Resource news website. 11 Dec 2024
Under the Freedom of Information Act (2000), I request the following information from your
authority in 20 working days please:

Please can you provide the following information about each planning appeal cost award or
partial cost award made for or against your council (including information for any now-defunct
councils that have been merged into your council) by planning inspectors between 1 April 2018
and 31 March 2024:

" Date of cost award decision

" Date of appeal decision letter (if different to date of costs award decision)

" Was the award for or against your council?

" Has the amount of the cost award been determined (yes/no)?

" Amount of sum (if determined) negotiated between the applicant and council for cost award
(£)

" Was the decision that was the subject of the appeal made against officer recommendation
(yes/no)?

" PINS case reference number

Please note that we are asking about planning appeal cost awards only, and not, for example,
awards that relate to enforcement or householder appeals.

It would be much appreciated if you could, where possible, provide information in the format
set out in the attached spreadsheet.

RESPONSE:

07/01/2025 - information provided re case reference number, unable to confirm cost data.
23/01/2025 - following further investigation, no further information available, assume that this
is because costs were not pursued by third party or ourselves.

FOI - Survey to gather information on the public sector's readiness for artificial intelligence 30 Jan 2025
(AI).

RESPONSE:
31/01/2025 - response to survey provided.

FOI - Please provide the latest inclusive language guide document for staff and other 17 Jan 2025
documents used for internal diversity training.

RESPONSE:
13/02/2025 - Final response - no information held (other than EDI policy)

07 Jan 2025

31 Jan 2025

13 Feb 2025

07 Jan 2025 YES

26 Feb 2025 YES

13 Feb 2025 YES

NO

NO

NO



PE\2025\ENQ\52061

PE\2025\ENQ\51861

PE\2025\ENQ\52008

FOI request re: 07 Mar 2025 24 Mar 2025 03 Apr 2025 YES

Farming in Protected Landscapes programme, as outlined below. For each question please
could you supply information for March 2021-March 2022, March 2022- March 2023, March
2023-March 2024 and March 2024- March 2025

" Which projects have received funding in the Peak District from the FiPL programme?

" How much money has gone to each individual project?

RESPONSE:

24/03/2025 - Final response - information provided via links to FiPL information on website.
Due to timing (year end, annual leave, DEFRA reporting requirements) unable to provide
breakdown but have advised that if the response does not meet fully the request, then to come
back to us.

FOI - T would like to request the following information regarding your organisation's 05 Feb 2025 28 Feb 2025 04 Mar 2025 YES
apprenticeship offerings:

1.What apprenticeship programmes are currently offered internally within your organisation?

2.Is your organisation an apprenticeship levy payer? If so, could you provide details about how

the levy is utilised?

3.The contact details (name, email, and/or phone number) for the person(s) responsible for

Learning & Development and apprenticeships within your organisation.

RESPONSE:
28/02/2025 - Final response - information provided

FOI - I am writing to obtain the following information under the Freedom of Information Act. 27 Feb 2025 26 Mar 2025 26 Mar 2025 YES
Please provide the following information for the 2022-2023 and 2023-2024 financial years:

- The total income your organisation received from the government in each year.
- Your organisation's total expenditure in each year.

- Your organisation's total staff headcount in each year.

- The year in which your organisation was originally founded

RESPONSE:
26/03/2025 - Final response - information provided

NO

NO

NO



PE\2025\ENQ\51686

PE\2025\ENQ\51930

PE\2025\ENQ\51719

FOI - This is an information request relating to quango staff being given permission to work 07 Jan 2025 28 Jan 2025 03 Feb 2025 YES
from outside the United Kingdom. By United Kingdom, I refer to Northern Ireland, England,
Wales and Scotland, not including the crown dependencies.

Please include the following information for the following financial years, 2021/22, 2022/23,
2023/24 :

The number of employees currently with permission to work outside of the United Kingdom

The number of employees who were given permission to work outside of the United Kingdom
in the 2021/22, 2022/23, 2023/24 financial years

If possible, for each employee given permission, please provide their pay band, and the
country which they were provided permission to work from

RESPONSE:
28/01/2025 - Final response, information provided

FOI - This is an information request relating to Equality, diversity and Inclusion roles in your 18 Feb 2025 05 Mar 2025 17 Mar 2025 YES
organisation.

Please see full information for request on the HUB.

RESPONSE:
05/03/2025 - Final response - information provided
FOI - Please note this is just about clarifying the disposal history of Losehill Hall; it isn't 15 Jan 2025 25 Feb 2025 28 Feb 2025 YES

associated with any other matters of relevance to the PDNPA such as a pending complaint or
actions. It's just a request for the facts etc.

See full details of request on HUB.

RESPONSE

11/02/2025 - information provided. Extend date to review Part B report pending release.
14/02/2025 - due to unforseen cirumstances date extended to 17/02/2025.

17/02/2025 - Part B contains 9 attachments which have not been included. Extended to
28/02/2025 to enable consideration of the attachments.

25/02/2025 - attachments provided

NO

NO

NO



